G:\M\I9\MURPNC\MURPNC_007.XML

[118I17174]

11910 CONGRESS
18T SESSION H o R.

To amend title XI of the Social Security Act to equalize the negotiation
period between small-molecule and biologic candidates under the Drug
Price Negotiation Program.

(Original Signature of Member)

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. MurprHy introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on

A BILL

To amend title XI of the Social Security Act to equalize
the negotiation period between small-molecule and bio-
logic candidates under the Drug Price Negotiation Pro-

oram.
1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,

g:\VHLD\010825\D010825.050.xml (959982I1)
January 8, 2025 (1:36 p.m.)



G:\M\I9\MURPNC\MURPNC_007.XML

2
SECTION 1. EQUALIZING THE NEGOTIATION PERIOD BE-

[E—

TWEEN SMALL-MOLECULE AND BIOLOGIC
CANDIDATES UNDER THE DRUG PRICE NEGO-

TIATION PROGRAM.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1192(e)(1)(A)(11) of the
Social Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1320f=1(e)(1)(A)(i1)) is
amended by striking “7 years” and inserting “11 years’ .

(b) EFrFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

O o0 9 N n B~ W

subsection (a) shall take effect as if included in the enact-

[S—
)

ment of Public Law 117-169.

g:\VHLD\010825\D010825.050.xml (959982I1)
January 8, 2025 (1:36 p.m.)




....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		119th CONGRESS
1st Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend title XI of the Social Security Act to equalize the negotiation period between small-molecule and biologic candidates under the Drug Price Negotiation Program.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. Murphy introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend title XI of the Social Security Act to equalize the negotiation period between small-molecule and biologic candidates under the Drug Price Negotiation Program.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Equalizing the negotiation period between small-molecule and biologic candidates under the Drug Price Negotiation Program.

(a) In general.—Section 1192(e)(1)(A)(ii) of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1320f–1(e)(1)(A)(ii)) is amended by striking “7 years” and inserting “11 years”.


(b) Effective date.—The amendment made by subsection (a) shall take effect as if included in the enactment of Public Law 117–169.






  
    G:\M\19\MURPNC\MURPNC_007.XML XXXXXXXXXX XXXXXX 1/8/2025 13:36 XXXXXX 01/08/2025 1:14 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXX   959982|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
   [118H7174] 
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Mr. Murphy introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend title XI of the Social Security Act to equalize the negotiation period between small-molecule and biologic candidates under the Drug Price Negotiation Program. 
 
  
  1. Equalizing the negotiation period between small-molecule and biologic candidates under the Drug Price Negotiation Program
  (a) In general Section 1192(e)(1)(A)(ii) of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1320f–1(e)(1)(A)(ii)) is amended by striking  7 years and inserting  11 years.
  (b) Effective date The amendment made by subsection (a) shall take effect as if included in the enactment of Public Law 117–169. 
 


